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Mediations 

 
(a) The number of disputes arising under or in 

connection with the agreement that were the 
subject of a mediation that commenced or 
ended in the reporting period. 

 
1 

(b) Information about the nature of the disputes 
referred to in paragraph (a). 

During the period between 1 May 2022 and 30 
April 2023, Riverina Fresh was party to one 
dispute with a supplier in relation to a milk 
supply agreement which was the subject of a 
mediation. The dispute was about the pricing of 
milk under the relevant milk supply agreements 
of several years which commenced in 2019.  

(c) The number of mediations conducted in the 
reporting period to resolve the disputes 
referred to in paragraph (a) and the average 
time taken to resolve the disputes. 

 
1 

 

(d) Information about the outcome of the 
disputes referred to in paragraph (a). 

The dispute did not resolve at mediation. 

 
Arbitrations 

 
(e) The number of disputes arising under or in 

connection with the agreement that were the 
subject of an arbitration that commenced or 
ended in the reporting period. 

 
0 

(f) Information about the nature of the disputes 
referred to in paragraph (e). 

 
- 
 

(g) The number of arbitrations conducted in the 
reporting period to resolve the disputes 
referred to in paragraph (e) and the average 
time taken to resolve the disputes. 

 
0 

(h) Information about the outcome of the 
disputes referred to in paragraph (e). 

 
- 
 


